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Overview: 
I am a Chartered Accountant with significant 
experience in Investment Banking. I am 
currently in my third year of doctoral studies. 
I am interested in studying caregiving from 
the perspective of the work-family interface. 

 
Area of specialization: OB & HR 
 
 
Year of joining the programme: 2020 
 
 
Email: fpm20@manasi@spjimr.org 
 
 
Educational background: 
CA, M.Com, PG in Development 
Management from SPJIMR 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

Research interest: Work-Family interface, 
Qualitative Research Methods, Role identity 
theory 
 

Professional appointments/ Work 
experience: I spent around nine years in 
Investment Banking with multinational 
banks including Deutsche Bank and Credit 
Suisse, followed by a brief period in the 
social sector. During this time, I collaborated 
with organisations that provided consulting 
services to NGOs and social enterprises. 

 
Publications and working papers: None 

 
Conference presentations: None 
 
Brown Bag/ Research Seminar 
presentations: None 

 
 
Achievements: Completed FPM course 
work, gave an alumni talk in Development 
Management course at SPJIMR and 
introduced PGDM participants to informal 
caregiving in Diversity in the Workplace 
course. 


